

## Ashland County Timber Sale Bid Results - July 2023

**Sale number**

8-18

<b>22 Acres</b>				Bidder	Bidder	Bidder	Bidder
<u>Species</u>	<u>Volume</u>	<u>Min Bid</u>	<u>Min Price</u>	<b>NO BID</b>			
MX Hardwood Pulp	430	\$15.00	\$6,450.00				
Red Pine Pulp	75	\$5.00	\$375.00				
Aspen Pulp	7	\$15.00	\$105.00				
Balsam Fir Pulp	30	\$1.00	\$30.00				
Hard Maple Logs	35	\$120.00	\$4,200.00				
MX Hardwood Logs	10	\$100.00	\$1,000.00				
Yellow Birch	15	\$100.00	\$1,500.00				
<b>Total</b>			<b>\$13,660.00</b>				

1-23

<b>39 Acres</b>				Bidder	Bidder	Bidder	Bidder
<u>Species</u>	<u>Volume</u>	<u>Min Bid</u>	<u>Min Price</u>	<b>RM Bay*</b>	<b>Radlinger</b>		
MX Hardwood Pulp	130	\$15.00	\$1,950.00	\$24.00	\$18.00		
Basswood Pulp	150	\$1.00	\$150.00	\$5.00	\$10.00		
Balsam Fir Pulp	10	\$5.00	\$50.00	\$5.00	\$6.00		
Hard Maple Logs	5	\$120.00	\$600.00	\$325.00	\$245.00		
MX Hardwood Logs	5	\$100.00	\$500.00	\$120.00	\$155.00		
Basswood Logs	20	\$100.00	\$2,000.00	\$120.00	\$121.00		
<b>Total</b>			<b>\$5,250.00</b>	<b>\$8,545.00</b>	<b>\$8,320.00</b>		

2-23

<b>90 Acres</b>				Bidder	Bidder	Bidder	Bidder
<u>Species</u>	<u>Volume</u>	<u>Min Bid</u>	<u>Min Price</u>	<b>Sappi*</b>			
MX Hardwood Pulp	600	\$15.00	\$9,000.00	\$27.70			
Basswood Pulp	170	\$1.00	\$170.00	\$1.70			
Ash Pulp	100	\$1.00	\$100.00	\$17.00			
Balsam Fir Pulp	30	\$5.00	\$150.00	\$5.00			
			\$0.00				
Hard Maple Logs	38	\$120.00	\$4,560.00	\$237.00			
Basswood Logs	24	\$100.00	\$2,400.00	\$157.00			
MX Hardwood Logs	24	\$100.00	\$2,400.00	\$137.00			
<b>Total</b>			<b>\$18,780.00</b>	<b>\$34,821.00</b>			

3-23	<b>58 Acres</b>				Bidder	Bidder	Bidder	Bidder
	<b>Species</b>	<b>Volume</b>	<b>Min Bid</b>	<b>Min Price</b>	<b>NO BID</b>			
	Basswood Pulp	140	\$1.00	\$140.00				
	MX Hardwood Pulp	500	\$15.00	\$7,500.00				
	Balsam Fir Pulp	15	\$5.00	\$75.00				
				\$0.00				
	Hard Maple Logs	30	\$120.00	\$3,600.00				
	Basswood Logs	20	\$100.00	\$2,000.00				
	Mx Hardwood Logs	8	\$100.00	\$800.00				
	<b>Total</b>			<b>\$14,115.00</b>				

4-23	<b>96 Acres</b>				Bidder	Bidder	Bidder	Bidder
	<b>Species</b>	<b>Volume</b>	<b>Min Bid</b>	<b>Min Price</b>	<b>NO BID</b>			
	MX Hardwood Pulp	525	\$15.00	\$7,875.00				
	Aspen Pulp	600	\$15.00	\$9,000.00				
	Balsam Fir Pulp	250	\$5.00	\$1,250.00				
	Spruce Pulp	95	\$15.00	\$1,425.00				
	Tamarack Pulp	10	\$5.00	\$50.00				
	Hard Maple Logs	4	\$120.00	\$480.00				
	Mx Hwd Logs	7	\$100.00	\$700.00				
	<b>Total</b>			<b>\$20,780.00</b>				

5-23	<b>60 Acres</b>				Bidder	Bidder	Bidder	Bidder
	<b>Species</b>	<b>Volume</b>	<b>Min Bid</b>	<b>Min Price</b>	<b>NO BID</b>			
	MX Hardwood Pulp	525	\$15.00	\$7,875.00				
	Red Pine Log & Pulp	150	\$45.00	\$6,750.00				
	Hard Maple Logs	12	\$120.00	\$1,440.00				
	Mx Hwd Logs	20	\$100.00	\$2,000.00				
	<b>Total</b>			<b>\$18,065.00</b>				

6-23	<b>33 Acres</b>				Bidder	Bidder	Bidder	Bidder
	<b>Species</b>	<b>Volume</b>	<b>Min Bid</b>	<b>Min Price</b>	<b>RM Bay*</b>	<b>Radlinger</b>	<b>Sappi</b>	<b>Ash Mat</b>
	MX Hwd Pulp	475	\$15.00	\$7,125.00	\$30.00	\$25.00	\$29.70	\$18.08
	Hard Maple Logs	45	\$125.00	\$5,625.00	\$375.00	\$230.00	\$277.00	\$353.10
	MX Hwd Logs	10	\$100.00	\$1,000.00	\$130.00	\$130.00	\$157.00	\$229.90
<b>Total</b>			<b>\$13,750.00</b>	<b>\$32,425.00</b>	<b>\$23,525.00</b>	<b>\$28,142.50</b>	<b>\$26,776.50</b>	

## Bid Result Summary

Sold

Average

	Volume		of Winning bids
MX Hardwd Pulp	1205	Cords	\$27.23
Aspen Pulp	0	Cords	\$0.00
Basswood Pulp	320	Cords	\$3.35
Balsam Fir	40	Cords	\$5.00
Spruce Pulp	0	Cords	\$0.00
Red Pine	0	Cords	\$0.00
Ash Pulp	100	Cords	\$17.00
White Birch Pulp	0	Cords	\$0.00
Hemlock	0	Cords	\$0.00
Tamarack Pulp	0	Cords	\$0.00
Hard Maple Logs	88	MBF	\$312.33
MX Hardwd Logs	39	MBF	\$129.00
Basswood Logs	44	MBF	\$138.50
Ash logs	0	MBF	\$0.00
Red Oak Logs	0	MBF	\$0.00
Soft Maple Logs	0	MBF	\$0.00
Red Pine Bolts/Logs	0	Cords	\$0.00

**Totals**

<b>Cords Sold</b>	<b>1665</b>
<b>MBF Sold</b>	<b>171</b>
<b>Acres Sold</b>	<b>162</b>
<b>Bids Received</b>	<b>7</b>